
 
 By-law 137-2025 

of The Corporation of the City of Oshawa 

Being a by-law to amend Schedules V, VI and VII of the Traffic and Parking By-law 79-99, as amended. 
  
Whereas the parking fees in Schedules V, VI, and VII of the Traffic and Parking Bylaw 79-99, as 
amended (“Traffic and Parking By-law 79-99") must be further amended to reflect the fees approved in 
the Fees and Charges By-law 109-2024, as amended, effective as of January 1, 2026; and, 
  
Whereas Lot 20, previously located at 31, 33, and 45 Simcoe Street North is no longer a City Parking 
Lot and therefore must be removed from Schedule V of the Traffic and Parking By-law 79-99; and, 
  
Whereas Council directed the implementation of a paid parking system at Lakeview Park and Ed 
Broadbent Park for non-Oshawa residents, on weekends, public holidays and during Council endorsed 
special events, valid on the same day, from May 15 to October 15 requiring that Parking Lots identified 
as Lots A, B, C, D, E, F, G, and H at Lakeview Park and Ed Broadbent Park must be added to Schedule 
V Traffic and Parking By-law 79-99, to incorporate paid parking for non-Oshawa residents, 
 
Therefore it is enacted as a By-law of the Corporation of the City of Oshawa as follows: 
 

1. That Schedule V, VI and VII, Rates of the Traffic and Parking By-law 79-99 is amended by deleting 
"$1.25 per hour" in its entirety and replacing it with the following: 

"$1.75 per hour."  
2. Schedule V, VI and VII, Column 4, Rates of the Traffic and Parking By-law 79-99 is amended by 

deleting "$12.50 daily maximum" in its entirety and replacing it with the following: 
"$17.50 daily maximum."  

3. Schedule V, Column 4, Rates of the Traffic and Parking By-law 79-99, is amended by deleting 
"$8.00 daily maximum" in its entirety and replacing it with the following: 

"$17.50 daily maximum."  
4. Schedules V and VI, Column 4, Rates of the Traffic and Parking By-law 79-99 is hereby amended 

by adding the following: 
  "Special event parking $5.50"  

5. Schedule VII, Rates of the Traffic and Parking By-law 79-99 is amended by deleting "73.00 dollars 
monthly" in its entirety and replacing it with the following: 

"Monthly permits of $84.00."  
6. Schedule V, Parking lots of the Traffic and Parking By-law 79-99is amended by deleting 31, 33 and 

45 Simcoe Street North (Public parking area on the Northeast Corner of Bond Street and Simcoe 
Street North), City Parking Lot #20.  

7. That Schedule V (Parking Lots) of the Traffic and Parking By-law 79-99 be hereby amended by 
deleting the fourth row of the Table in Schedule V and replace it with the following new row: 

Land Facility Days and Hours Rate 
Maximum 
Permissible 
Parking Period 

Method of 
Control 

74 Carriage 
Works Drive 

Parking 
Lot 19 

8:00 a.m. to 6:00 
p.m., Monday to 
Friday inclusive, 
except Holidays 

Monthly 
Permit Rate 
$84.00, plus 
applicable 
tax 

24 hours Parking 
Control 
Device 



8. That Schedule VI (Parkades) of the Traffic and Parking By-law 79-99 be hereby amended by 
deleting the rows and replacing with the following new rows: 

Land Facility Days and Hours Rate 
Maximum 
Permissible 
Parking Period 

Method of 
Control 

All And Singular 
that certain 
parcel or tract of 
land and 
premises, 
situate, lying and 
being in the City 
of Oshawa, in 
the Regional 
Municipality of 
Durham and 
being composed 
of all of lots 4, 5, 
6, that portion of 
Prince Street 
closed by By-law 
12-73 and the 
east part of Lot 3 
all south of Bond 
Street West, 
also the north 
part of Lots 4, 5, 
6 north of King 
Street, all 
according to J.B 
. Warren’s Plan 
“A“. 

Parkade 
No. 1 

8:00 a.m. to 6:00 
p.m., Monday to 
Friday inclusive, 
except Holidays 

$1.75 per 
hour for the 
$17.50 daily 
maximum. 
Monthly 
Permit Rate 
$100.00 
(plus 
applicable 
tax) 

48 hours Attendant 
and/or 
Parking 
Control 
Device 

All And Singular 
that certain 
parcel or tract of 
land and 
premises, 
situate lying and 
being composed 
of Lots C-2. C-3 
and part of Lot 
C-4, sheet 10, 
Oshawa 
Municipal Plan 
registered as 
No. 335, said 
parcel or tract 
being more 
particularly 
described as 
Parts 1 and 2 on 
survey of record 
registered as 
Plan 40R-5498. 

 

Parkade 
No. 2 

 Monthly 
Permit Rate 
$100.00 
(plus 
applicable 
tax) 

 Parking 
Control 
Device 

Lot 13 and part 
of Lot 14, south 
of Bond Street 
and part of Lots 
11 and 12, east 
of Mary Street 
Registered Plan 
No. 71, Lots C-
43 and C-44 and 
part of Lots C- 
41, C-42 and C-
45, sheet 8 
Registered Plan 
No. 335 City of 

Parkade 
No. 3 

8:00 a.m. to 
9:00 p.m., 
Monday to 
Friday, inclusive, 
except Holidays 

$1.75 per 
hour for the 
$17.50 daily 
maximum. 
Monthly 
Permit Rate 
$100.00 
(plus 
applicable 
tax) 
Special 
event 
parking 
$5.50 

48 hours Attendant 
and/or 
Parking 
Control 
Device 



Oshawa, Region 
of Durham, 
designated as 
parts 4, 5, 10 
and 11 on 
Reference Plan 
40R-12395 

9. That Schedule V (Parking Lots) of the Traffic and Parking By-law 79-99 be hereby amended by 
adding the following new rows: 

Land Facility Days and Hours Rate 
Maximum 
Permissible 
Parking Period 

Method of 
Control 

55 Lakeview 
Park Avenue  

Parking 
lot A 

May 15 to October 
15, Saturday to 
Sunday, including all 
public holidays and 
Council-endorsed 
special events 

$20.00 Daily 
Rate for 
unregistered 
vehicles  

18 hours Parking 
Control Device 

55 Lakeview Park 
Avenue  

Parking 
lot B 

May 15 to October 
15, Saturday to 
Sunday, including all 
public holidays and 
Council-endorsed 
special events 

$20.00 Daily 
Rate for 
unregistered 
vehicles  

18 hours Parking 
Control Device 

55 Lakeview Park 
Avenue  

Parking 
lot C 

May 15 to October 
15, Saturday to 
Sunday, including all 
public holidays and 
Council-endorsed 
special events 
 

$20.00 Daily 
Rate for 
unregistered 
vehicles  

18 hours Parking 
Control Device 

55 Lakeview Park 
Avenue  

Parking 
lot D 

May 15 to October 
15, Saturday to 
Sunday, including all 
public holidays and 
Council-endorsed 
special events 
 

$20.00 Daily 
Rate for 
unregistered 
vehicles  

18 hours Parking 
Control Device 

1500 Simcoe 
Street South 

Parking 
lot E 

May 15 to October 
15, Saturday to 
Sunday, including all 
public holidays and 
Council-endorsed 
special events 
 

$20.00 Daily 
Rate for 
unregistered 
vehicles  

18 hours Parking 
Control Device 

55 Lakeview Park 
Avenue  

Parking 
lot F 

May 15 to October 
15, Saturday to 
Sunday, including all 
public holidays and 
Council-endorsed 
special events 
 

$20.00 Daily 
Rate for 
unregistered 
vehicles  

18 hours Parking 
Control Device 

55 Lakeview Park 
Avenue  

Parking 
lot G 

May 15 to October 
15, Saturday to 
Sunday, including all 
public holidays and 
Council-endorsed 
special events 
 

$20.00 Daily 
Rate for 
unregistered 
vehicles  

18 hours Parking 
Control Device 

169 Harbour Road  Parking 
lot H 

May 15 to October 
15, Saturday to 
Sunday, including all 
public holidays and 
Council-endorsed 
special events 

$20.00 Daily 
Rate for 
unregistered 
vehicles  

18 hours Parking 
Control Device 



10. This by-law shall come into full force and effect on January 1, 2026.   
 
 
 
By-law passed this Fifteenth day of December, 2025. 

 __________________________ ___________________________ 
 Mayor City Clerk 





Accessibility Report





		Filename: 

		137-2025.pdf









		Report created by: 

		



		Organization: 

		







[Enter personal and organization information through the Preferences > Identity dialog.]



Summary



The checker found problems which may prevent the document from being fully accessible.





		Needs manual check: 0



		Passed manually: 2



		Failed manually: 0



		Skipped: 0



		Passed: 29



		Failed: 1







Detailed Report





		Document





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Accessibility permission flag		Passed		Accessibility permission flag must be set



		Image-only PDF		Passed		Document is not image-only PDF



		Tagged PDF		Passed		Document is tagged PDF



		Logical Reading Order		Passed manually		Document structure provides a logical reading order



		Primary language		Passed		Text language is specified



		Title		Passed		Document title is showing in title bar



		Bookmarks		Passed		Bookmarks are present in large documents



		Color contrast		Passed manually		Document has appropriate color contrast



		Page Content





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Tagged content		Passed		All page content is tagged



		Tagged annotations		Passed		All annotations are tagged



		Tab order		Passed		Tab order is consistent with structure order



		Character encoding		Passed		Reliable character encoding is provided



		Tagged multimedia		Passed		All multimedia objects are tagged



		Screen flicker		Passed		Page will not cause screen flicker



		Scripts		Passed		No inaccessible scripts



		Timed responses		Passed		Page does not require timed responses



		Navigation links		Passed		Navigation links are not repetitive



		Forms





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Tagged form fields		Passed		All form fields are tagged



		Field descriptions		Passed		All form fields have description



		Alternate Text





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Figures alternate text		Passed		Figures require alternate text



		Nested alternate text		Passed		Alternate text that will never be read



		Associated with content		Passed		Alternate text must be associated with some content



		Hides annotation		Passed		Alternate text should not hide annotation



		Other elements alternate text		Passed		Other elements that require alternate text



		Tables





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Rows		Passed		TR must be a child of Table, THead, TBody, or TFoot



		TH and TD		Passed		TH and TD must be children of TR



		Headers		Passed		Tables should have headers



		Regularity		Failed		Tables must contain the same number of columns in each row and rows in each column



		Summary		Passed		Tables must have a summary



		Lists





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		List items		Passed		LI must be a child of L



		Lbl and LBody		Passed		Lbl and LBody must be children of LI



		Headings





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Appropriate nesting		Passed		Appropriate nesting










Back to Top



